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which.blood transfusion and bone marrow
transplantation, and their effect on human oral

squamous cell carcinoma. the human oral
squamous cell carcinoma (oscc) cell lines

underwent transfusion in vitro with cultured human
peripheral blood mononuclear cells. after

transfusion, the tumor cells in culture maintained
the growth-dependent properties of the original

tumor cells. when transfused into nude mice, these
cultured tumor cells were able to grow and

metastasize at a higher rate than did the controls.
in contrast, the transfused cells did not maintain
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the capacity to produce interleukin-2, secretory
interleukin-2 receptor, or tumor necrosis factor.

neither bone marrow (bm) nor blood mononuclear
cells (bmnc) administered to nude mice in vivo

prevented growth of oscc cells transplanted in the
gingival of nude mice. oral squamous cell

carcinoma cells were also exposed to radiation
(xrt). after xrt, the remaining small fraction of the
originally transfused oscc cells was enhanced in

radiation-induced enhancement of the
tumorigenicity, that is, tumor growth in nude mice
after transfusion was increased in xrt alone group.
the growth of tumor cells in an immunosuppressed
condition was studied in bmnc in vitro. when the

gingival of nude mice was injected with the in vitro
irradiated oscc cells, there was no effect on

tumorigenicity and tumor growth. on the other
hand, when the bmnc of nude mice was transfused
in the same manner as bm, bmnc of tumor-bearing

nude mice, the transplanted tumor cells were
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induced to proliferate. thus, the blood mononuclear
cells of tumor-bearing nude mice may have a role

in enhancing the growth of gingival tumors by
transfusion.q: why can't i printf variables with

leading zeros in c? in this example, i couldn't get a
4 char word printed. for example, if i run the code
below, i get: something else i changed the char*

input to an integer, and i get the same result.
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